Item # Item Name Manufacturer Base Bid/Bid Unit
10600 Advance Pierre 0.298
10600 Kings Delight 0.39
10600 Chicken, Nugget, WG breading, no soy/vpp added Koch Foods 0.2868
10600 Wayne Farms Did Not Bid
10600 Perdue 0.69
10601 Advanced Pierre 0.410
10601 Chicken, patty, WG breading, no soy/vpp added Kings Delight .39
10601 Koch Foods 0.2868
10602 Kings Delight 0.187
10602 Chicken, for Biscuit, WG, precooked Advance Pierre 0.232
10602 Koch Foods 0.1663
10603 Chicken, Tenderloins, Whole Muscle, WG Kings Delight 2.83
10603 Koch Foods 2.39
10604 Clux Delux 4.52
10604 Chicken, breast, grilled, whole muscle, 3 0z minimum Pilgrims 4.253
10604 Tyson 3.7
10605 Chicken, patty, grilled, white meat only, un-breaded Advance Pierre 0'36_9
10605 Koch Foods No Bid
10606 Chicken, wings, Precooked, Hot flavor, IQF Pigrims Pride 3.69
10606 Tyson NO BID
10608 Koch Foods 2.79
10608 Diced Chicken, approx. 1/2 “ pieces, 60/40 white/dark blend, No VPP Tyson 2.70
10608 Quantum Foods Did Not Bid
10609 Quesadilla, Chicken and cheese, filling (WG) Coyote Grill
10610 Chicken, Tenders, Chopped and Formed, no added skin, WG breading, KOCh Foc.>ds 02971
10610 Kings Delight 0.39
CN Label -
10610 Advance Pierre 0.444
16300 Tyson 0.409861
16300 Crispito, chicken and chili, WG, pre-fried, CN labeled Tyson 0.378889
16300 Windsor .239
16301 Chicken, Fajita Meat, Seasoned Strips, fully cooked Kings Delight 3.02
16301 Tyson 2.42
10611 Clux Delux 0.98
10611 Chicken, BNLS, BRST,WG Breaded, Whole muscle, no pressed products Tyson 0.6775
10611 Proview Foods .70
10612 Kings Delight 0.98
10612 Chicken, BNLS, BRST, WG Breaded, Spicy flavor, Whole muscle, no Pilgrims Pride .7671
10612 pressed products Koch Foods 0.2818

10612

10623

Chicken, Asian, WG Breaded, citrus sauce, fully cooked

10623

Proview Foods

.695

10623

10623

Chicken, Bite, Whole Muscle, WG Breaded, precooked

10623

10623

16001

Wayne Farms Did Not Bid
Pilgrim's Pride 3.0683
Gold Kist 3.0683
Tyson 2.42
Proview Foods 2.7
Proview Foods 3

Asian Foods

2.32

16001

Chicken, Asian, General Tso, WG breaded, fully cooked

Chef's Corner

2.32




Item # Item Name Manufacturer Base Bid/Bid Unit
16001 Ling's 5th Taste 2.5069
16002 chicken, Asian, mandarin style, fully cooked .A5|an Foods 2.5638
16002 Ling's 5th Taste 2.3706
16003 Chicken, Asian, spicy, fully cooked .A5|an Foods 2.7270
16003 Ling's 5th Taste 2.4283
16004 Chicken, Asian, Sweet and Sour - Schwan's 441
16004 Ling's 5th Taste 2.5069
16005 Asian Foods 2.5405
16005 Chicken, Asian, teriyaki, fully cooked Ling's 5th Taste 2.4283
16005 Schwan's 3.2386
10614 Beef, Patties, Fully cooked, flame broiled fully cooked Advance Pierre 0.349
10614 Don Lee Farms 0.2730
10615 Beef, Pattie, WG Breaded, fully cooked Advance Pierre 0.422
10615 Don Lee Farms 0.4047

Sausage, Link style, no VPP, fully cooked

Beef, Nugget, Steak, WG Breaded, fully cooked, No VPP
16100 M.C.I. Foods 0.4139
16100 Burrito, Breakfast, Egg, sausage, and cheese, WG, precooked Foster Farms .551
16100 Cargill .528
10003 Beef, WG Breaded, Steak for Biscuit, chopped and formed Advance P!erre $0.4660
10003 Advance Pierre 0.419
10005 Beef, patty, Salisbury style, chopped and formed, precooked Advance Pierre 0.325
10005 Don Lee Farms 0.3489
10400 Frankfurters, 8/1, All Beef Armour Did Not Bid
10400 Nathan's 2.70
16200 Corndog, Lowfat, whole grain batter, Turkey frank, precooked Foster Farms 49
16200 Monogram .345
10500 Pork, patty, Rib Shaped, fully cooked Don Le.e 0.2826
10500 Advance Pierre 0.271
10501 Brookwood Farms 4.46
10501 Pork, Barbecue, Pulled, Dry Pack, No Sauce Farmland 3.16
10501 Quantum Foods Did Not Bid
10502 Southern Quality No Spec
10502 Sausage, Pattie, fully cooked, Whole Hog, Minnimum 1.5 oz cooked ConAgra (Odom's) 0.1472
10502 Williams 0.1856
10503 Don Lee Farms 0.3038
10503 . Foster Farms .375

Sausage, Pancake on a stick

10503 Sara Lee 0.2759
10503 Sara Lee 0.3373

Bryan

Sausage, Smoked, Rope Style

Country Meat Packers

10506 sausage, Cocktail, smoked, CN labeled
10507 Ham, thin sliced, reduced sodium, L Polks | 25

10508

Unan Dicruit 2 E" dianmatar

Polk's

2.52




Item # Item Name Manufacturer Base Bid/Bid Unit
10508 TIATT DISEETG, e e Sunset Farm Foods Did Not Bid
16101 WG Biscuit, Sausage, IW, Precooked, Whole Hog W|II|am? -3937
16101 Advanced Pierre 0.370
10511 Ham, buffet, oval shape, fully cooked Armour Did Not Bid
10511 Polk's 2.02

16400 Pocket style enrobed sandwich, Pepperoni, WG, precooked Schwan's (Tony's) .6675

13005 Potatoes, Instant, Dehydrated, w/o dry milk, add water only Basic American - — 1'4_176 n —
13005 Idahoan Disqualified During Bid Opeining
13010 Heinz 25.19
13010 Tomato Sauce, 6/10 Hunts 19.87
13010 ConAgra Foods 20.76
13011 Spaghetti Sauce, 6/10 Angel.a Mia 27.47
13011 Heinz 34.07
13012 Heinz 28.56
13012 Tomato Ketchup, 6/10 Heinz 22.57
13012 Hunts 20.30
13013 Heinz 33.41
13013 Tomato Paste, 6/10 Hunts 32.54
13013 ConAgra (Hunts) 35.79
13014 Angela Mia 19.70
13014 Tomatoes, Diced in juice 6/10 Heinz 27.59
13014 ConAgra 19.70
13227 lamb Weston No Bid
13227 Oven Cook French Fries, 5/16" straight cut, Bakeable Lamb Wo.iston No Bid
13227 McCain .706
13227 Simplot .6757
13232 Lamb Weston No Bid
13232 McCain .696
13232 Oven Cook French Fries, 3/8" Crinkle Cut, bakeable Simplot .7232
13232 Cavendish Farms 0.6574
13232 Cavendish Farms No Bid
13233 Roasted Potatoes, 55-60 ct, frozen McCaln -80
13233 Simlpot 1.4582
13234 Sweet potato fries, 3/8" cut, ovenable Lam-b Weston 1.24
13234 Simplot 1.3256
13238 Potato, Wedges Frozen McCain Foods .8419
13238 Lamb Weston No Bid

19021

19021

Heinz

Barbecue Sauce, Mild, Smokey flavor, 1 gal

19017 Heinz 18.45
19017 Honey Mustard Dressing, Single serve, 1 oz min size M:'-)rzettl 14.983
19017 Ken's Foods 14.15
19017 CF Sauer 8.7300
19020 Heinz 6.31
19020 Jam, Strawberry, Single serve, 0.5 0z minimum CF Sauer 5.5850
19020 Diamond Crystal No Specifications

4.92

Jelly, Apple, Single serve cup, 0.5 0z minimum

CF Sauer

3.9800




Item # Item Name Manufacturer Base Bid/Bid Unit
19022 Heinz 5.02
19022 Jelly, Grape, single serve CF Sauer 3.9600
19022 Diamond Crystal No Specifications
19023 Mayonnaise, Reduced Fat, Single serve CFISauer (Dukes's) 3'8_1_5 -
19023 Diamond Crystal No Specifications
19024 Marzetti No Bid
19024 . . Ken's Foods 7.6262
Mayonnaise, Regular, Single serve
19024 CF Sauer 3.8550
19024 Heinz 9.29
19025 Guldens Spicy mustard 2.7940
19025 Mustard, Prepared, Single serve, 5.5 gram min Heinz 3.06
19025 CF Sauer No Bid
Barbecue Sauce, Single serve Did Not Bid
19028 Ketchup, Individual, Low Sodium, 9 gram, foil pack only Heinz 2.95
19028 Hunts 1.3955
19029 Sweet and Sour Sauce, Single serve cup, 1oz cup Heinz - 15'9_7
19029 Marzetti No Bid
19030 Flavor Fresh Did Not Bid
19030 Table Syrup, Single serve cup, 10z cup Heinz 14.70
19030 CF Sauer 6.7500
19031 Taco sauce, Single serve, Medium flavor, 9 gram min | Heinz ]| 50 |
19032 Heinz 17.37
19032 Tarter Sauce, Single serve, 12 gram min Marzetti No Bid
19032 Ken's Foods 17.93
19033 Heinz 17.37
19033 Salad Dressing, Fat free, Buttermilk Ranch, Single Serve, 12 gram size Marzetti 4.461
19033 Sauer 3.9150
19033 Diamond Crystal No Specifications

19036

Salad Dressing, Reduced Calorie, Buttermilk Ranch, Single serve, 1 1/2

Heinz 25.93

19036

19037

oz size

Salad Dressing, Reduced Calorie, 1000 Island, Single serve, 1 1/2 oz size

Ken's Foods 22.7666

Heinz 24.08

19038 Salad Dressing, Reduced calorie, French, Single serve, 1 1/2 oz size Heinz 24.42
19039 Salad Dressing, Fat free, Italian, Single serve, 1 1/2 oz size Heinz - 22.08
19039 Marzetti 11.733
16500 Giorgio 0.5961
16500 The Max 0.1708
16500 WG, Breaded Mozzarella Cheese Sticks Tony's .2780
16500 Schwan's No Bid
16500 ConAgra Foods 0.2031
16501 Pizza, cheese topping, 4 x 6 rectangle WG, 16 grams fat per serving The Max No Bid
16501 . Tony's .4670
maximum
16501 Nardone Brothers .4791
16502 The Max 0.3698
16502 Pizza, sausage, 4 x 6 rectangle WG, 16 grams fat per serving maximum Tony's .4869
16502 Nardone Brothers .4791




Item # Item Name Manufacturer Base Bid/Bid Unit
16503 Pizza, Pepperoni, 4 x 6 rectangle WG, 16 grams fat per serving The Max 0.3702
16503 maximum Tony's .4670
16504 Pizza, Sausage, Wedge shaped WG, 16 grams fat per serving maximum The Max 0'375,0
16504 Tony's No Bid
16505 The Max 0.4436
16505 Pizza, Cheese Topping, Cheese Stuffed Crust, wedge shaped, WG Red Baron :6298
16505 ConAgra 0.6111
16505 ConAgra 0.4778
16506 The Max 0.4844
16506 Red Baron .6298
16506 Pizza, Pepperoni Topping, Cheese Stuffed Crust, wedge shaped, WG Best Express No Bid
16506 ConAgra 0.5417
16506 ConAgra 0.5067
16507 Red Baron .7488
16507 Pizza, French bread style, 6", Pepperoni, WG, 21 grams fat per serving Nardone Brothers .7166
16507 maximum Nardone Brothers .6666
16507 Best Express .5137
16102 Breakfast bagel, Sausage and cheese, WG Tasty Brands Did Not Bid
16509 Breakfast Pizza, sausage and cheese, WG The Max 0.2135
16509 Tony's .3418
16512 Pizza, frozen, Mexican style, WG, maximum 12 gram fat per serving Tony's :6106
16512 Nardone Brothers .5208
16513 Schwan's (Red Barron) .8511
16513 Tony's No Bid
16513 Pizza pies, Cheese, 16" minimum diameter round, WG, maximum 14 Best Express .5699
16513 grams fat per serving Alpha .6220
16513 Alpha .594
16513 Uno Foods 0.72
16514 Pizza pies, Pepperoni, 16" minimum diameter round, WG, maximum 14 Tony's 8511
16514 . Nardone Brothers .7812
grams fat per serving
16514 Uno Foods 0.753
16515 Pizza, Cheese Topping, 5" round individual, WG, low sodium The M'ax 0.4980
16515 Tony's .7485
16516 Pizza, Pepperoni Topping, 5" round individual, WG, low sodium The M'ax 05500
16516 Tony's .7485
16518 Pizza,Pepperoni, wedge shaped, WG, 16 grams fat per serving Best Express .5994
16518 maximum Schwan's .4871
16519 Pizza,cheese topping, Wedge shaped, WG, 16 grams fat per serving Best Express .5699
16519 maximum Schwan's .4871
16110 Pizza, WG Breakfast, IW ovenable package, Sausage/Egg/Cheese Beacon Stree:‘. Café '430,3
16110 Advanced Pierre No Bid
14006 Rich's 6.215
14006 Sister Schubert 12.1
14006 Dynamic Foods did not bid
14006 Frozen Foods Processors Did Not Bid
14006 Roll dough, Whole wheat, 1.5 0z maximum Otis Spunkmyer 9.1666
14006 Rich's Products 10.781
14006 Specialty Foods 12.00
14006 Wenner Bread 7.20




16103

16103

16104

16104

16104

16104

16105

Pancakes, Frozen, WG, 4" minimum diameter, 1.1 0z minimum wt

Toast, French Toast Sticks WG, Heat and serve

Waffle Sticks, WG, minimum 2 sticks per serving, precooked

Item # Item Name Manufacturer Base Bid/Bid Unit
14006 Lantmannen 7.1744
14007 Best Express 34.91
14007 Cinnamon Roll Dough, Frozen, WG, 20z Rich's 14.464
14007 J&J Snack 0.1353
14008 AdvancePierre 10.486
14008 Breadsticks, Whole Wheat, 10z minimum I-!arlan Bakery 17.40
14008 Rich's Products 6.04
14008 ConAgra No Bid
14012 Tyson Foods 0.15625
14012 Tyson Foods No Bid
14012 WG, Tortilla, Soft Flour, size to be 10" maximum Azteca 0.093518
14012 Azteca 0.222292
14012 Ole Mexican No Bid
14012 Ole Mexican 0.129
14200 Keebler 3.516
14200 WG Crackers, salad style, Sunshine 3.493
14200 Westminster Not ID On Envelope
14201 Lance Disqualified
14201 Crackers, Saltines, WG Zesta/K.eIIogg 6.70

14201 Westminster Not ID On Envelope
14201 Snyders Lance Disqualified

Aunt Jemima

14001 Bread, Hamburger buns, 4" buns, sliced, 100% whole grain white wheat Flowers 0.14
14001 only Hadley Farms Bakery .1606
14001 J&J Snack 0.2970
14003 Bread, Hoagie/Sub buns, 6" buns, side sliced,100% whole grain white Lantmannen Unibake 0.17
14003 wheat only Flowers 0.176
14015 Pilsbury 18.1019
14015 J&J Snacks 18.67
14015 Biscuit, Southern Style, Wholegrain, 2 oz., white wheat Pilsbury - 18.1019
14015 Bama Companies 18.80
14015 Peach Valley Bakery 13.22
14015 C.H. Guenther 14.53
14016 Pilsbury 13.0952
14016 Biscuit, Southern Style, Wholegrain, 1 oz., white wheat C.H. Guenther 8.98
14016 Rich's Products 6.696
14017 Pilsbury 17.1019
14017 Biscuits, southern style, 2 oz Rich's 12.225
14017 Hom/Ade $11.5900

Disqualified During Review

Nestle

Did Not Bid

General Mills No Bid
Biscomerica No Bid
Michael Foods Did Not Bid

Aunt Jemima

General Mills

Disqualified During Review

14020

14020

14020

Waffles, Mini, IW ovenable package, WG, precooked, Minimum two
flavors

Muffins, Apple, WG, IW, precooked

General Mills

48.0278

Kellogg's Company

0.3463

Dave's 0.212
Dessert Innovatins .228125
Super Bakery .228




Item # Item Name Manufacturer Base Bid/Bid Unit

14020 Aryzta-Otis Spunkmeyer .235
.|

14021 Dave's 0.212

14021 Pilsbury No Bid

14021 Super Bakery .228

14021 Muffins, Blueberry, WG, IW, precooked Aryzta-Otis Spunkmeyer .235

14021 Sky Blue 0.201

14021 Dessert Innovations .228125

14021 JSB Muffin Town
—

14022 Dessert Innovations .228125

14022 Super Bakery .228

14022 Muffin, Banana, WG, IW, precooked Sara Lee 0.2688

14022 JSB Muffin Town .184

14022 Dave's 0.212
|

14023 Brownie, IW, WG, precooked Dave's - 0.19

14023 Dessert Innovations .224375

18204

Snack bar, Marshmallow/Crisped Rice Treats, Individually Wrapped in

18204

18205

Muffin, Choc Chip, IW, precooked Aryzta-Otis Spunkmeyer
18100 Otis Spunkmeyer 7.6822
18100 Cookietree $12.4800
18100 Cookie Dough, Low fat, colored candy pieces, WG, unbaked weight 1 oz 18 ?n'ack Foc.)ds 10.480
18100 David's Cookies 9.31

max. wt -

18100 Rich's Products 11.458
18100 Michael's Bakery 6
18100 Hope's Did Not Bid
18101 Hope's Did Not Bid
18101 Otis Spunkmeyer 6.7421
18101 Rich's Products 9.791
18101 Cookie Dough, Low fat Chocolate Chip, WG, unbaked weight 1 oz max. Cookietree $12.3900
18101 wt J&J Snack Food 10.02
18101 David's Cookies 8.69
18101 Michael's Bakery 6
18101 Best Maid Did Not Bid
18102 J&J Snack Foods 9.63
18102 Hope's Cookies Did Not Bid
18102 Otis Spunkmeyer 6.0208
18102 Cookie Dough Low fat Sugar, WG, unbaked weight 1 oz max. wt Rich's - 11'45_8
18102 Dessert Innovations No Bid
18102 Cookietree $10.7600
18102 David's Cookies 8. 69
18102 Michael's Bakery
18103 Otis Spunkmeyer 6.8515
18103 Cookie Dough, Low fat, Oatmeal raisin, WG, unbaked weight 1 oz max. B_GSt Mald, Did Not Bid
18103 wt David's Cookies 8.69
18103 Michael's Bakery 6
18103 Hope's Did Not Bid
14026 Cinnamon Bun, Wrapped, 2.5 0z minimum size Super Bakery 31.00
14026 J&J Snack Foods 29.05
18302 Keebler 0.1694
18302 Graham Cracker Snack, cinnamon flavor, WG, packed in individual MM 0.115
18302 serving bags MM 0.115
18302 Quaker Hill Farms 0.175

foil

Snack bar, whole grain, Chocolate flavored, WG, whole grain rice and

Kellogg 0.3137
MaltoMeal Did Not Bid
Kellogg's 0.2454




Item #

Item Name

Manufacturer Base Bid/Bid Unit

18205

14102-14112

oat

Cereal, Bowl Pack, WG, Minimum 10 varieties, Must include minimum 2

14102-14112

14113-14115

reduced sugar varities,

14113-14115

Cereal Bar, Fruit filled, WG, Minimum three flavors,

14113-14115

14027

14027

General Mills (Betty Crocker) 0.276042

General mills, Kelloggs 0.354896
Kelloggs 0.2012
Kellogg NutriGrain 0.2639
McKee Foods, Inc. 2173958
Darlington No Spec Sheet

Chewy cereal bar made with whole grain cereal pieces, IW, Minimum

14027

14103

three flavors/varieties

General Mills 0.276000
Darlington No Spec Sheet
J&J Snack Foods 0.2960

Kellogg's General Mills 0.1843

Cereal, single serve pouch, WG, Minimum 2 varieties

14103

16108, 16119, 16120

15109, 15110, 15126

15002-15005

Toasted Pastry, filled, frosted, WG, Minimum two flavors

Juice Bar/sorbet, Frozen, assorted flavors, 100% fruit/fruit juice, No
added high fructose corn syrup

15002-15005

General Mills 0.301042

Kellogg's

J&J Snack Foods 0.2187

Veryfine Fruit 20 Disqualifed During Review

Water, naturally flavored, sugar free, no calorie, minimum three flavors,

maximum size 20 fl oz.

15002-15005

15012-15015

Sports Drink, Low calorie, Isotonic, Non carbonated, minimum three

15012-15015

10800

flavors, maximum size 20 fl oz

10800

Nantze Springs No Spec Sheeet
Propel 0.4166
Pepsico (Gatorade) 0.375
Coke a Cola (Powerade) Did Not Bid

Yogurt, Nonfat, Strawberry 4 oz

10800

10801

10801

Dannon .205
Upstate Farms $0.2031
General Mills (Yoplait) 0.291250

10801

Yogurt, Nonfat, Strawberry-Banana 4 oz

10801

10804

10804

Dannon .205
Upstate Farms .203125

Chobani .40
General Mills (Yoplait) 0.291250

Yogurt, single service, squeezeable packaging, strawberry flavor

10804

18001-18005

Chips, Potato, Baked chips, Minimmum of three flavors to include

18001-18005

General Mills 0.290000
Chobani .28
Dannon 279

regular, barbaque, and Sour Cream and onion, 1 1/4 oz maximum

18001-18005

18007-18008

18010, 18013, 18012

package size

Chips, Tortilla, Baked, WGs, 1 1/4 oz maximum package size, minimum
two flavors

Chips, Corn, Baked, minimum three flavors, 10z min package, To be of

18006
18016

19134

Rachel's Disqualifed During Review
Frito Lay 33.00
Popchips Did Not Bid

Frito Lay 16.50

Frito Lay 16.50

equal or greater quality as Sun Chips

Cheese Curls, Baked, Corn flour puffs, minimmum of two flavor

Chips, Corn, Extruded, Curled, WG, bulk

19134

19134

19134

19134

Mix, Gravy, Brown, Low Sodium, Complete mix, Boil water to complete

19134

19134

19134

19135

| Fritolay | 1650 |
1.8125
Lawrey's Did not Bid
LeGout Did Not Bid
Durkee Did Not Bid
McCormick Did Not Bid
Trio Did Not Bid
Southeastern Mills .1648
CH Guenther 0.2205
Shawnee Milling 0.1983
Pioneer 0.2369




20212

20212

20212

20212

16111

16111

16111

16111

14028

16114

16115

15121-15125

15121-15125

15121-15125

15121-15125

15121-15125

Platter, Salad Style, 9 x 7 Oval, Foam

Plate, Foam, 9" round, 3 Compartment

WG, Breakfast Wrap, Egg/Meat/Cheese, IW, ovenable packaging,
minimum 2.5 oz.

Roll, Cinnamon, mini pull apart, IW ovenable packages, WG, pre-baked
frozen, Maximum 2.5 oz per package

Breakfast Sandwich, WG, Egg & Chees, IW ovenable packages, fully
cooked

Sausage, Egg, and Cheese Breakfast Sandwich, IW ovenable packages,
WG, fully cooked

Juice, Fruit, Sparkling, Minimum of four flavors,

Burrito, Beef & Bean, Bulk, WG, Non fried, Pre-Cooked, minimum

Item # Item Name Manufacturer Base Bid/Bid Unit
19135 Durkee Did Not Bid
19135 Lawrey's Did not Bid
19135 Mix, Gravy, Chicken, Low Sodium, Complete mix, Boil water to complete Trio Did Not Bid
19135 Southeastern Mills No Bid
19135 CH Guenther 0.2480
19135 Shawnee Milling 0.1569
|

19136 Lawrey's Did not Bid
19136 LeGout Did Not Bid
19136 Trio Did Not Bid
19136 Mix, Gravy, Country Style, Low Sodium, Complete mix, Boil water to Pioneer 0.1330
19136 complete Southeastern Mills .1236
19136 CH Guenther 0.1215
19136 Shawnee Milling 0.1080
19136 Shawnee Milling No Bid

20704 Spork, Disposable, Wrapped, Medium wt 2.5 grams per spork minimum, Disposo Did Not Bid
20704 White, 6" length Dart Did not Bid
20208 Trays, School lunch, 5 Compartment, Approximately 10 3/8"X 8 3/8" G.enPak - 3.08 -
20208 Dispozo Did Not Bid
20209 GenPak 6.24
20209 Trays, 3 Compartment, Hinged Lid, Foam, 9"x9"x3" Sweetheart D'_d Not B_'d
20209 Dart Did not Bid
20209 Dispozo Did Not Bid

GenPak 2.61
Solo Did Not Bid
Sweetheart Did Not Bid
Dispozo Did Not Bid

Foster Farms .454

M.C.l. Foods $0.4124

M.C.I. Foods $0.4313
Integrated Food Service 0.479

General Mills

Advanced Pierre

Schwan's 55227

0.437500

0.342

4303

Campbells Soup 0.59
Epic, LLC 0.4779
Apple & Eve .4417
Envy .405

Cutting Edge Beverages

portion size 5 oz

16302 ) ) Fernando's .678
portion size 5 oz
16303 Burrito, Beef & Bean, IW'O\'lenabIe pa'ckag?_, WG, Non fried, Pre-Cooked, Fernando's 686
minimum portion size 5 oz
16302 Burrito, Beef & Bean, Bulk, WG, Non fried, Pre-Cooked, minimum MCI (Los Cabos) $0.4583




Item #

Item Name

Manufacturer

Base Bid/Bid Unit

16303

Burrito, Beef & Bean, IW ovenable package, WG, Non fried, Pre-Cooked,
minimum portion size 5 oz

MCI (Los Cabos)

$0.4749

10702

Cod, Squares, WG Breaded, cut from solid fillet block, precooked,not to
exceed 10g fat per serving, oven or fry cook, NO sodium
tripolyphosphate, NO MSG, NO VPP

American Seafood (Friornor)

.4090

10703

Cod, Nuggets, WG Breaded, cut from solid fillet block, precooked,not to
exceed 10g fat per serving, oven or fry cook, NO sodium
tripolyphosphate, NO MSG, NO VPP

American Seafood (Highliner)

.430

10702

Cod, Squares, WG Breaded, cut from solid fillet block, precooked,not to
exceed 10g fat per serving, oven or fry cook, NO sodium
tripolyphosphate, NO MSG, NO VPP

Channel fish Processing

0.4334

10703

Cod, Nuggets, WG Breaded, cut from solid fillet block, precooked,not to
exceed 10g fat per serving, oven or fry cook, NO sodium
tripolyphosphate, NO MSG, NO VPP

Channel fish Processing

0.4683

10702

Cod, Squares, WG Breaded, cut from solid fillet block, precooked,not to
exceed 10g fat per serving, oven or fry cook, NO sodium
tripolyphosphate, NO MSG, NO VPP

Trident Seafoods

.4181

10703

Cod, Nuggets, WG Breaded, cut from solid fillet block, precooked,not to
exceed 10g fat per serving, oven or fry cook, NO sodium
tripolyphosphate, NO MSG, NO VPP

Trident Seafoods

0.46

13031 Pickles, Kosher Dill Spears, 1/4 cut, 75 ct average Heinz 6.04
13032 Pickles, Sliced Dills, 1/8" smooth slices, Heinz 5.504
13033 Pickles, Whole Dills, medium size Heinz 5.492
13034 Pickle Relish, Sweet Heinz 6.97
13031 Pickles, Kosher Dill Spears, 1/4 cut, 75 ct average Kaiser 5.635
13032 Pickles, Sliced Dills, 1/8" smooth slices, Kaiser 4.44
13033 Pickles, Whole Dills, medium size Kaiser 5.4675
13034 Pickle Relish, Sweet Kaiser 5.83

13228 French Fries: Deep Fry, 5/16" Straight Cut Lamb Weston No Bid
k F h Fri keabl N fats, 1/4"
13229 Oven Cook French Fries, bakeab e. potatoes,No trans fats, 1/. Lamb Weston No Bid
Shoestring
13230 Potato Rounds Frozen, Ovenable OR Deep fry cylinder shape Lamb Weston No Bid
13231 Hash Browns, Patties Pre-cooked, 2.25-3 oz patty Lamb Weston No Bid
13228 French Fries: Deep Fry, 5/16" Straight Cut Ore-lda .6610
k F h Fri keabl N fats, 1/4"
13229 Oven Cook French Fries, bakeab e. potatoes,No trans fats, 1/. Ore-lda 7363
Shoestring
13230 Potato Rounds Frozen, Ovenable OR Deep fry cylinder shape Ore-lda .6010
13231 Hash Browns, Patties Pre-cooked, 2.25-3 oz patty Ore-lda .8326
13228 French Fries: Deep Fry, 5/16" Straight Cut Simplot .5957
- 1/a"
13229 Oven Cook French Fries, bakeable' potatoes,No trans fats, 1/4 simplot 7282
Shoestring
13230 Potato Rounds Frozen, Ovenable OR Deep fry cylinder shape Simplot .6207
13231 Hash Browns, Patties Pre-cooked, 2.25-3 oz patty Simplot .7307

14000

Pullman loaf, sliced, 100% whole grain white wheat only .9 oz per slice
minimum size

Flowers

0.056

14002

Bread, Hot dog buns, 6" buns, sliced, 100% whole grain white wheat
only

Flowers

0.126

16106

Pancake, Mini, Berry flavor, WG, Individually wrapped ovenable
packages, pre-baked frozen,

General Mills

0.480278




packages, pre-baked frozen,

Item # Item Name Manufacturer Base Bid/Bid Unit

16107 Pancake, Mini, Maple flavor, WG, Individually wrapped ovenable General Mills 0.480278
packages, pre-baked frozen,

16106 Pancake, Mini, Berry flavor, WG, Individually wrapped ovenable Kellogg's 0.3325
packages, pre-baked frozen,

16107 Pancake, Mini, Maple flavor, WG, Individually wrapped ovenable Kellogg's 0.3325

Orange Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top, NO "K" pack, No

added flavors, sweetners or color added

15100 added flavors, sweetners or color added. Ardmore 1198
15102 Grape Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, No Ardmore 1175
added flavors, sweetners or color added
15104 Orange/Pineapple Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top. NO "K Ardmore 1457
pack, No added flavors, sweetners or color added
15106 Orange Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 6 oz, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, No Ardmore 1578
added flavors, sweetners or color added
15108 Apple Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 6 oz, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, No Ardmore 1313
added flavors, sweetners or color added
ice, Fi , ,4 0z, le Top, NO "K" k, N
15100 Orange Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top, NO pac o Sun Cup 09857
added flavors, sweetners or color added.
ice, F 3 ,4 02z, le Top. NO "K" pack, N
15102 Grape Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top. NO pac o Sun Cup 09086
added flavors, sweetners or color added
Pi | ice, F , ,4 0z, le Top. NO "K"
15104 Orange/Pineapple Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top. NO Sun Cup 10029
pack, No added flavors, sweetners or color added
ice, F 2 , 602, le Top. NO "K" pack, N
15106 Orange Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 6 oz, Gable Top. NO pac o Sun Cup 13314
added flavors, sweetners or color added
Apple Juice, F ) , 6 0z, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, N
15108 pple Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 6 oz, Gable Top. NO pac o Sun Cup 0.09929
added flavors, sweetners or color added
15100 Orange Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top, NO "K" pack, No Mr. J 0.1299
added flavors, sweetners or color added.
15102 Grape Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, No Mr. J 0.1287
added flavors, sweetners or color added
15104 Orange/Pineapple Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top. NO "K Mr. J 0.1502
pack, No added flavors, sweetners or color added
15106 Orange Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 6 0z, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, No Mr. J 0.1617
added flavors, sweetners or color added
Apple Juice, F le Top. NO "K" pack, N
15108 pple Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 6 oz, Gable Top. NO pac o Mr. J 0.1300

Apple Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, No

added flavors, sweetners or color added

15103 Ard .1021
added flavors, sweetners or color added ramore
15105 Fruit Juice Blend, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, Ardmore 1064
No added flavors, sweetners or color added
15107 Grape Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 6 0z, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, No Ardmore 1544
added flavors, sweetners or color added
15103 Apple Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, No Sun Cup 07657
added flavors, sweetners or color added
it Juice B - e ]
15105 Fruit Juice Blend, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top. NO "K" pack Sun Cup 08071
No added flavors, sweetners or color added
15107 Grape Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 6 0z, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, No Sun Cup 11643
added flavors, sweetners or color added
15103 Apple Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, No Mr. J 0.1087
added flavors, sweetners or color added
it Juice B - e ]
15105 Fruit Juice Blend, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top. NO "K" pack Mr. J 0.1133
No added flavors, sweetners or color added
15107 Grape Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 6 0z, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, No Mr. J 0.1599




added flavors, sweetners or color added

Item # Item Name Manufacturer Base Bid/Bid Unit
15103 Apple Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, No Apple & Eve No Bid
added flavors, sweetners or color added
Fruit Juice Blend, Frozen, unsweetened, 4 oz, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, .
15105 No added flavors, sweetners or color added Apple & Eve No Bid
15107 Grape Juice, Frozen, unsweetened, 6 oz, Gable Top. NO "K" pack, No Apple & Eve No Bid

15000 Water, Plain, Spring water, maximum size 20 fl oz Nantze Springs No Spec Sheeet
15001 Water, Plain, Spring water, Maximum size 8 fl oz. plastic bottles Nantze Springs No Spec Sheeet
15000 Water, Plain, Spring water, maximum size 20 fl oz Niagra Bottling No Debarment
15001 Water, Plain, Spring water, Maximum size 8 fl oz. plastic bottles Niagra Bottling No Debarment
15000 Water, Plain, Spring water, maximum size 20 fl oz Crystal Geyser .10
15001 Water, Plain, Spring water, Maximum size 8 fl oz. plastic bottles Crystal Geyser .105

19128 Base, Ham Custom Disqualified During Bid Opeining
19129 Base, Beef, Low sodium Custom Disqualified During Bid Opeining
19130 Base, Chicken, Low sodium Custom Disqualified During Bid Opeining
19128 Base, Ham Eatem Did not Bid
19129 Base, Beef, Low sodium Eatem Did not Bid
19130 Base, Chicken, Low sodium Eatem Did not Bid
19128 Base, Ham Legout Did Not Bid
19129 Base, Beef, Low sodium Legout Did Not Bid
19130 Base, Chicken, Low sodium Legout Did Not Bid
19128 Base, Ham Major Did Not Bid
19129 Base, Beef, Low sodium Major Did Not Bid
19130 Base, Chicken, Low sodium Major Did Not Bid

20107 Cups, Squat, Foam, White, 4 oz Dart Did not Bid
20108 Lid, for 4 oz squat cup Dart Did not Bid
20109 Cups, Squat, Foam, White, 6 oz Dart Did not Bid
20124 Lid, for 6 oz squat cup Dart Did not Bid
20110 Cups, Squat, Foam, White, 8 oz Dart Did not Bid
20111 Lid, for 8 oz squat cup Dart Did not Bid
20112 Cups, Squat, Foam, White, 12 oz Dart Did not Bid
20113 Lids, for 12 oz squat cup Dart Did not Bid
20114 Cups, Drink, 8 oz, Foam, White Dart Did not Bid
20125 Lids, for 8 oz squat cup Dart Did not Bid
20115 Cups, Drink, 12 oz, Foam, White Dart Did not Bid
20116 Cups, Drink, Tall, 14 oz, Foam, White Dart Did not Bid
20117 Cups, Drink, 16 oz, Foam, White Dart Did not Bid
20119 Lids, for foam drink cup w/straw slot Dart Did not Bid
20107 Cups, Squat, Foam, White, 4 oz Wincup Did Not Bid
20108 Lid, for 4 oz squat cup Wincup Did Not Bid
20109 Cups, Squat, Foam, White, 6 oz Wincup Did Not Bid
20124 Lid, for 6 oz squat cup Wincup Did Not Bid
20110 Cups, Squat, Foam, White, 8 oz Wincup Did Not Bid
20111 Lid, for 8 oz squat cup Wincup Did Not Bid
20112 Cups, Squat, Foam, White, 12 oz Wincup Did Not Bid
20113 Lids, for 12 oz squat cup Wincup Did Not Bid
20114 Cups, Drink, 8 0z, Foam, White Wincup Did Not Bid
20125 Lids, for 8 oz squat cup Wincup Did Not Bid
20115 Cups, Drink, 12 oz, Foam, White Wincup Did Not Bid
20116 Cups, Drink, Tall, 14 oz, Foam, White Wincup Did Not Bid
20117 Cups, Drink, 16 oz, Foam, White Wincup Did Not Bid
20119 Lids, for foam drink cup w/straw slot Wincup Did Not Bid




Item # Item Name Manufacturer Base Bid/Bid Unit
Knife, Disposable,Wrapped, Heavy Weight, 4.6 grams per knife .
20700 minimum, Polypropylene, Black, Min length to be 6" Max Packaging 17.99
Forks, Disposable, Wrapped, Heavy Weight, 4.6 grams per knife .
20701 minimum, Polypropylene, Black, Min length to be 6" Max Packaging 17.99
Fork/Napkin Set, Disposable, Fork to be Heavy wt Polypropylene, Black,
20702 Minimum fork weight 4.6 grams, Length 6 1/4", Napkin to be single ply, Max Packaging 28.55
mimimum 13" X13"
20703 Spoons, Dispo.sa.ble, Wra:‘pped, Heavy weight, 4.6 grams per spoon Max Packaging 17.51
minimum, 6" length, Polypropylene, Black
20700 Knife, l?is.posable,Wrapped, Heavy Weigf.\t, 4.6 grams per"knife Dispozo Did Not Bid
minimum, Polypropylene, Black, Min length to be 6
20701 Forks, D.is.posable, Wrapped, Heavy Weig!'lt, 4.6 grams pe: knife Dispozo Did Not Bid
minimum, Polypropylene, Black, Min length to be 6
Fork/Napkin Set, Disposable, Fork to be Heavy wt Polypropylene, Black,
20702 Minimum fork weight 4.6 grams, Length 6 1/4", Napkin to be single ply, Dispozo Did Not Bid
mimimum 13" X13"
20703 Spoons, Dispo.sa.ble, Wra:‘pped, Heavy weight, 4.6 grams per spoon Dispozo Did Not Bid
minimum, 6" length, Polypropylene, Black
Knife, Di le,W ,H Weight, 4. knif
20700 nife .ls.posab e,Wrapped, Heavy elg.t 6 grams per" nife Daxwell 14.78
minimum, Polypropylene, Black, Min length to be 6
Forks, Di le, W , H Weight, 4. knif
20701 orks .ls.posab e, Wrapped, Heavy elg. t, 4.6 grams pelr‘ nife Daxwell 14.78
minimum, Polypropylene, Black, Min length to be 6
Fork/Napkin Set, Disposable, Fork to be Heavy wt Polypropylene, Black,
20702 Minimum fork weight 4.6 grams, Length 6 1/4", Napkin to be single ply, Daxwell 25.38
mimimum 13" X13"
, Di le, W , H ight, 4.
20703 Spoons, Disposable, Wrapped, Heavy weight, 4.6 grams per spoon Daxwell 14.58

minimum, 6" length, Polypropylene, Black

20410 Bags, Freezer/Storage, 18 x 24, include ties Handgard Did Not Bid
20411 Bags, Freezer/Storage, 27 x 37, to cover bun pan, include ties Handgard Did Not Bid
20412 Bags, Freezer/Storage, 18 x 30, to cover steam table pan, include ties Handgard Did Not Bid
20413 Cover, Bun Pan Rack, 52 x 80 Handgard Did Not Bid
20414 Bag, Serving and Transport, Steam table pan liner bag, 34 x 25 Handgard Did Not Bid
20410 Bags, Freezer/Storage, 18 x 24, include ties Atlantis Did Not Bid
20411 Bags, Freezer/Storage, 27 x 37, to cover bun pan, include ties Atlantis Did Not Bid
20412 Bags, Freezer/Storage, 18 x 30, to cover steam table pan, include ties Atlantis Did Not Bid
20413 Cover, Bun Pan Rack, 52 x 80 Atlantis Did Not Bid
20414 Bag, Serving and Transport, Steam table pan liner bag, 34 x 25 Atlantis Did Not Bid
20410 Bags, Freezer/Storage, 18 x 24, include ties Food Handler Did Not Bid
20411 Bags, Freezer/Storage, 27 x 37, to cover bun pan, include ties Food Handler Did Not Bid
20412 Bags, Freezer/Storage, 18 x 30, to cover steam table pan, include ties Food Handler Did Not Bid
20413 Cover, Bun Pan Rack, 52 x 80 Food Handler Did Not Bid
20414 Bag, Serving and Transport, Steam table pan liner bag, 34 x 25 Food Handler Did Not Bid

Can Liners, Poly, Reprocessed material bag, Extra heavy, Star sealed or

gusset sealed, Minimum 1.5 mil or 38 microns thickness, to fit 40 gal can

20516 Amcel Did Not Bid
gusset sealed, Minimum 1.5 mil or 38 microns thickness, to fit 40 gal can mee 1@ Not Bl
Can Liners, Poly, Reprocessed material bag, Extra heavy, Star sealed or ., .

20517 Amcel Did Not Bid
gusset sealed, Minimum 1.5 mil or 38 microns thickness, to fit 55 gal can mee 1@ Not Bl

20522 Small Trash Bags .5 mil Minnimum, 16 gallon Maximum can liner Amcel Did Not Bid

20516 Can Liners, Poly, Reprocessed material bag, Extra heavy, Star sealed or Sunbelt Did Not Bid




Item # Item Name Manufacturer Base Bid/Bid Unit
20517 Can Liners, Poly,‘ R‘eprocessed.materlal Pag, Extr? heavy, Sta‘r sealed or sunbelt Did Not Bid
gusset sealed, Minimum 1.5 mil or 38 microns thickness, to fit 55 gal can
20522 Small Trash Bags .5 mil Minnimum, 16 gallon Maximum can liner Sunbelt Did Not Bid
20516 Can Liners, Poly,‘ R‘eprocessed.material Pag, Extr? heavy, Sta‘r sealed or Rubbermaid Did Not Bid
gusset sealed, Minimum 1.5 mil or 38 microns thickness, to fit 40 gal can
Can Li , Poly, R d material bag, Extra h , St led . . .
20517 an Liners, Po y‘ ‘eprocesse ‘ma eria ‘ ag, Ex r? eavy, a‘r sealed or Rubbermaid Did Not Bid
gusset sealed, Minimum 1.5 mil or 38 microns thickness, to fit 55 gal can
20522 Small Trash Bags .5 mil Minnimum, 16 gallon Maximum can liner Rubbermaid Did Not Bid
20516 Can Liners, Poly,‘ R‘eprocessed‘materlal Pag, Extr.a heavy, Sta‘r sealed or Fortune Did Not Bid
gusset sealed, Minimum 1.5 mil or 38 microns thickness, to fit 40 gal can
20517 Can Liners, Poly,‘ R‘eprocessed‘materlal Pag, Extr.a heavy, Sta‘r sealed or Fortune Did Not Bid
gusset sealed, Minimum 1.5 mil or 38 microns thickness, to fit 55 gal can
20522 Small Trash Bags .5 mil Minnimum, 16 gallon Maximum can liner Fortune Did Not Bid
20516 Can Liners, Poly,' R'eprocessed'materlal 'bag, Extr.a heavy, Sta'r sealed or Mohawk Did Not Bid
gusset sealed, Minimum 1.5 mil or 38 microns thickness, to fit 40 gal can
20517 Can Liners, Poly,' R'eprocessed'materlal 'bag, Extr.a heavy, Sta'r sealed or Mohawk Did Not Bid
gusset sealed, Minimum 1.5 mil or 38 microns thickness, to fit 55 gal can
20522 Small Trash Bags .5 mil Minnimum, 16 gallon Maximum can liner Mohawk Did Not Bid
Can Liners, Poly, Reprocessed material bag, Extra heavy, Star sealed or . .
20516 Rollpak Did Not Bid
gusset sealed, Minimum 1.5 mil or 38 microns thickness, to fit 40 gal can P
Can Liners, Poly, Reprocessed material bag, Extra heavy, Star sealed or . .
20517 Rollpak Did Not Bid
gusset sealed, Minimum 1.5 mil or 38 microns thickness, to fit 55 gal can P
20522 Small Trash Bags .5 mil Minnimum, 16 gallon Maximum can liner Rollpak Did Not Bid
Can Liners, Poly, Reprocessed material bag, Extra heavy, Star sealed or . .
20516 Pitt Plastic 13.2800
gusset sealed, Minimum 1.5 mil or 38 microns thickness, to fit 40 gal can $
Can Liners, Poly, Reprocessed material bag, Extra heavy, Star sealed or . .
20517 Pitt Plastic 15.9200
gusset sealed, Minimum 1.5 mil or 38 microns thickness, to fit 55 gal can $
20522 Small Trash Bags .5 mil Minnimum, 16 gallon Maximum can liner Pitt Plastic $18.9300




